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Tujuan: Penelitian ini mengkaji faktor-faktor yang menyebabkan 
keterlambatan dalam penyampaian laporan keuangan pemerintah di 
Sulawesi Barat dan mengusulkan solusinya.   
Metode: Penelitian ini menggunakan pendekatan studi kasus kualitatif 
dengan memperoleh data melalui wawancara mendalam dengan sepuluh 
informan dan menganalisisnya menggunakan analisis tematik.   
Hasil: Penelitian ini mengidentifikasi tujuh belas faktor yang 
menyebabkan keterlambatan dalam penyampaian laporan keuangan. 
Solusi yang diusulkan mencakup pengembangan aplikasi pemantauan 
untuk pengiriman laporan.   
Kebaruan: Penelitian ini memberikan kebaruan empiris terkait 
penyebab dan solusi hambatan utama dalam bidang akuntansi sektor 
publik.   
Kontribusi: Penelitian ini memberikan wawasan empiris untuk 
membantu instansi pemerintah meningkatkan ketepatan waktu dan 
akurasi dalam pelaporan keuangan.  

   

 

1. Introduction 
The implementation of decentralized 

government accounting is carried out in a 
hierarchical manner by accounting and 
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financial reporting units at both central and 
regional offices [1,2]. In the application of the 
institutional accounting system (SAI), 
decentralization takes the form of establishing 
accounting and financial reporting units in 
accordance with the organizational hierarchy 
[3,4]. Putra [5], as supported by Darmawan 
and Nugroho [6], explains that the 
organizational units involved in the 
implementation of SAI consist of the user 
accounting unit (UAKPA), the regional user 
accounting unit (UAPPA-W), the echelon 1 
user accounting unit (UAPPA-E1), and the 
ministerial user accounting unit (UAPA). 
Financial reports prepared by institutions 
within Ministries/Agencies (K/L) are also 
submitted to institutions within the scope of 
the Ministry of Finance (Kemenkeu), as 
stipulated by Minister of Finance Regulation 
(PMK) No. 222/PMK.05/2016 [7,8]. 

The financial reports prepared by the 
UAKPA are submitted to the State Treasury 
Office (KPPN), the UAPPA-E1, and the 
UAPPA-W [9,10]. The financial reports (LK) 
prepared by UAPPA-W are submitted to the 
Regional Office (Kanwil) of the Directorate 
General of Treasury (DJPb) and UAPPA-E1 
[10,11]. Meanwhile, the reports prepared by 
UAPPA-E1 and the UAPA are submitted to 
the Ministry of Finance, specifically to the 
Directorate General of Treasury [12,13]. To 
ensure the timely submission of financial 
reports to stakeholders, the Ministry of 
Finance has established a schedule for the 
preparation and submission of financial 
reports by each accounting unit to the higher-
level institution and to the Ministry of Finance 
[14,15], as outlined in Table 1. However, the 
timeliness of financial report submission 
remains significantly below expectations 
[16,17]. According to financial report 
submission monitoring data, only 6.82% of 
the reports were submitted on time. An 
additional 11.36% were delayed by one to 
seven calendar days, while 81.82% were 
delayed by more than seven calendar days. 

According to Kimmel et al. [18], timely 
submission of financial reports to 
stakeholders enhances the quality of the 

financial statements. Timeliness is crucial 
because financial reports are needed by users 
of the information to make informed decisions 
[19,20]. If delayed, decisions made by 
policymakers based on late reports may no 
longer be relevant [21,22]. Furthermore, 
delays in the preparation and submission of 
UAPPA-W financial reports can negatively 
affect the preparation of financial statements 
at both the Echelon I and Ministry levels 
[23,24]. This adverse impact includes the 
potential for incomplete and inaccurate 
financial reports prepared by the respective 
Echelon I units of each UAPPA-W [25–27]. 
Such consequences can ultimately affect the 
quality of the central government's financial 
reports [28–30], as the Government Financial 
Statement (LKPP) is, in essence, a 
consolidation of all financial reports from 
central government agencies [31–33]. 

Several studies have examined the issue 
of timely financial report preparation. 
Rafsanjani and Cheisviyanny [34] conducted 
research on the delays in submitting village 
budget realization accountability reports. 
Their findings identified four obstacles that 
prevent village officials from preparing 
financial reports in a timely manner: the 
quality of human resources, facilities and 
infrastructure, community participation, and 
internal control. Wati [35] conducted a study 
on the delays in submitting financial reports at 
the Solok State Treasury Service Office 
(KPPN) for the year 2017. The study revealed 
that the delays were caused by inadequate 
information technology and weak internal 
control systems within the organization. 
Another study on the timeliness of 
government financial report preparation was 
conducted by Basna et al. [36]. Their findings 
indicated that human resources and regional 
budget planning significantly impacted the 
delays in financial reporting in Boven Digoel 
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Regency, while delays caused by contractors 
did not have a significant effect on the 
timeliness of the regency's financial report 
submission [36]. 

There is still limited research in 
accounting that specifically explores the 
factors influencing the timeliness of financial 
report preparation at the UAPPA-W level 
within the central government. Based on this 
research gap and observed phenomena, this 
study aims to address two main questions: (1) 
What factors contribute to delays in the 
submission of financial reports at the UAPPA-
W level within the scope of West Sulawesi 
Province? and (2) What solutions can be 
implemented to mitigate the risks of such 
delays in the future? It is expected that 
insights into these factors will provide 
valuable input for the government in 
formulating policies related to the submission 
of financial reports by government agencies. 

 
2. Method 

Referring to Table 2, the basis for 
selecting our research informants is twofold. 
First, to understand the reasons for the delays 
in financial report submissions by UAPPA-W 

units, we conducted direct interviews with the 
financial report preparers of UAPPA-W units 
that have consistently experienced significant 
delays over the past three years in the West 
Sulawesi region, such as the Regional Office 
of the Ministry of Religious Affairs 
(Kemenag), the Regional Police Department 
(Polda), the National Road Management 
Agency (BPJN), and the High Prosecutor’s 
Office (Kejati). Second, to formulate effective 
solutions based on the technical experience of 
UAPPA-W financial report preparers, we 
interviewed three UAPPA-W units that have 
consistently submitted their financial reports 
on time for the past three years. These 
punctual UAPPA-W units in the West 
Sulawesi region include the Regional Office 
of DJPb, the Regional Office of the Ministry 
of Law and Human Rights (Kemenkumham), 
and the Regional Office of the Central Bureau 
of Statistics (BPS). In general, interviews 
were conducted more than once, with each 
session lasting between 30 to 60 minutes. The 
interviews were recorded and transcribed for 
further analysis. 

The data analysis method employed to 
achieve the objectives of this research is 
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Figure 2. Thematic Analysis: Axial Coding Results  
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Table 1. Government Financial Report Submission Schedule  

Unit 
Submission Schedule 

Interim Report Annual Report (Unaudited) 
UAKPA 15th July 2XX0 22nd January 2XX1 

UAPPA-W 21st July 2XX0 5th February 2XX1 
UAPPA-E1 26th July 2XX0 15th February 2XX1 

UAPA 31st July 2XX0 28th February 2XX1 
Source: Finance Minister Decree Number PMK-222/PMK.05/2016 

 

Figure 1. UAPPA-W of West Sulawesi Submission Facts 
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thematic analysis. According to Saunders et 
al. [37], thematic analysis is a commonly used 
approach for analyzing qualitative data. In 
applying thematic analysis, researchers must 
code qualitative data to identify themes for 
further analysis [38,39]. Thematic analysis 
offers a systematic approach by providing an 
organized and logical method for examining 
qualitative data [40,41]. The first research 
objective, which focuses on identifying the 
causes of delays in UAPPA-W financial 
report submissions, and the second objective, 
which addresses solutions for mitigating these 
delays, were analyzed using a four-step 
thematic analysis procedure. Generally, the 
thematic analysis process adapted the steps 
proposed by Qadri and Jauhari [42], albeit 
with some modifications. The thematic 
analysis procedure we employed consists of 
four stages, as summarized in Figure 1. 

The first stage involves the initial coding 
process, or the labeling of each sentence or 
paragraph in the transcript [43]. This process 
is carried out using three methods: descriptive 
coding, which labels sentences by assigning 
nouns to name the codes [44,45]; process 
coding, which involves labeling each sentence 
with verbs to name the codes [46,47]; and in-
vivo coding, where the coding is based on 
words found directly within the sentence to 
name the codes [48]. To implement the entire 
coding process during this initial stage, the 
researcher used the interview transcript of 
"Informant K" as a trial for applying the initial 
coding process. After all sentences and 
paragraphs in the transcript were labeled using 
the three coding methods mentioned, the 
researcher conducted a second review to 
create a coding template to be used in the 
second stage. 

The second stage is the line-by-line 
coding process, where the researcher applies 
the coding template developed in the first 
stage to code each sentence and paragraph in 
the interview transcripts of the remaining 
seven informants [49–51]. The researcher 
refined the codes for each transcript analyzed 
during this stage. Additions, revisions, or 
deletions of codes were made iteratively until 

a set of codes that appropriately addressed the 
research topic—related to the causes of delays 
in UAPPA-W financial report submissions 
and potential solutions—was finalized. 

The third stage involves focused coding 
and categorization. In this stage, the 
researcher revisited all the codes formulated 
and proceeded to classify and group codes 
with similar meanings [52,53], while 
eliminating codes that were irrelevant to the 
research topic [37]. At this point, all identified 
codes from the second stage were categorized 
into two major groups: "challenges in 
financial report submission" and "solutions to 
prevent delays." 

The fourth stage is axial coding and 
memo-writing. During the axial coding 
process, the researcher connected all the 
grouped codes from the third stage using an 
inductive approach [48]. The researcher 
reflected on the broader picture of causes and 
solutions, exploring the interconnections 
between individual codes and between code 
groups [54,55]. Following this, the researcher 
engaged in memo-writing, a process of 
composing memos to articulate the theoretical 
constructs that had emerged and to convey the 
concerns raised by the informants involved in 
the study [43]. Memo-writing is a crucial step 
to ensure that the researcher stays on track 
throughout the study [56]. Qualitative 
research typically involves lengthy durations 
and complex data, and memos help maintain 
the researcher's clarity and focus on current 
developments [57,58]. 

Figure 2 presents an example of the axial 
coding process, illustrating the findings 
related to the first research objective 
concerning the causes of delays. Referring to 
Figure 2, it is evident that the causes of delays 
in UAPPA-W financial report submissions 
can be grouped into six clusters. From these 
six clusters, we constructed a narrative to 
address the first research question regarding 
the causes of UAPPA-W financial report 
delays. Some similar codes were combined to 
strengthen the argument and provide readers 
with a more coherent and enjoyable reading 
experience [59,60]. 
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3. Result and Discussion 
Based on the interviews conducted with 

all informants, the factors contributing to 
delays in the submission of UAPPA-W 
financial reports can be categorized into six 
clusters: (1) management of state-owned 
assets (BMN), (2) financial data management, 
(3) human resources, (4) utilization of 
information technology, (5) internal 
organizational factors, and (6) external 
organizational factors. 

Delay Causes from the BMN 
Management Cluster. The BMN cluster 
comprises various issues encountered by work 
units (satker) in managing BMN data. Based 
on interviews, problems in managing BMN 
data were the most frequently reported by the 
informants. All interviewed UAPPA-W units 
experienced challenges related to BMN data 
management. The BMN data managed by the 
satker include fixed assets and current assets 
such as inventories. Until 2021, the 
applications used to manage BMN data were 
"SIMAK BMN" and the inventory 
management application. Meanwhile, the "e-
rekon&LK" application was used for 
monitoring BMN data issues. Starting in 
2022, satker have used the "SAKTI" 
application, specifically the fixed assets and 
inventory modules, to manage BMN data. 
BMN data are crucial in the preparation and 
submission of financial reports because the 
values of fixed assets and inventories on the 
balance sheet are derived from BMN 
management. UAPPA-W cannot submit 
financial reports until BMN data issues are 
resolved. Therefore, the resolution of BMN 
data problems significantly influences the 
timeliness of financial report preparation and 
submission. Several BMN-related issues 
encountered by satker have been identified as 
the primary causes of delays in UAPPA-W 
financial report submissions. Cause 1: BMN 
Data Anomalies  

According to monitoring conducted by 
the DJPb Regional Office of West Sulawesi 
up to 2021, many satker still experienced 
BMN data anomalies. These anomalies 
include BMN values showing negative, the 

number of BMN units appearing as negative 
or decimal, negative acquisition values, 
discrepancies between satker BMN data and 
BMN data at the Ministry of Finance, among 
others. In early 2022, DJPb requested that 
satker experiencing BMN data anomalies 
resolve them through the "Confirmation Work 
Paper" (K3) procedure. Informant K from the 
Ministry of Religious Affairs (Kemenag) 
stated: "The issue is around K3 and the 
procedure to address BMN data anomalies." 
– Interview transcript, April 21, 2022. 

Resolving anomalies was necessary to 
facilitate the migration from the old 
information system to the new one. However, 
several challenges were encountered during 
the K3 procedure: (1) Some satker delayed 
executing the K3 procedure. Informant K 
noted that by March 2022, some satker had yet 
to implement the K3 procedure; (2) Informant 
P stated that the K3 procedure caused 
previously accurate BMN data to show 
anomalies. Rectifying these anomalies took a 
significant amount of time, as the operators 
had to locate the problematic data among 
thousands of BMN entries; (3) Informant N 
mentioned that the K3 procedure led to 
discrepancies in fair value data. Resolving this 
issue delayed report preparation because the 
K3 procedure occurred too close to the 
reporting deadline; (4) Informant K reported 
that the K3 procedure caused cases where 
transaction journals appeared in the SIMAK 
BMN application but were absent in the 
SAIBA application, likely due to a missed 
update in one of the applications. Cause 2: 
BMN Transfer Discrepancies  

BMN transfer transactions between 
satker within the same ministry or across 
ministries are known as TK/TM. Both the 
sending and receiving satker must record 
these transactions accurately in their 
respective applications. If either party fails to 
record the transaction or makes an error, it 
leads to BMN data discrepancies. For 
example, if the sending satker records the 
outgoing BMN but the receiving satker fails 
to record the incoming BMN, the asset will be 
missing from the records. Conversely, if the 
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receiving satker records the incoming BMN 
while the sender fails to record the outgoing 
BMN, the asset will be recorded twice. 
TK/TM discrepancies can be monitored using 
the "e-rekon&LK" application. In practice, 
discrepancies between BMN transfers still 
frequently occur. Informant P from the West 
Sulawesi Police Department (Polda) provided 
the following information:  

"We still have TK/TM discrepancies with 
satker C. The resolution is pending a 
SIMAK application update. It relates to the 
Confirmation Work Paper. After that, we 
will submit the unaudited version before 
moving to the audited version." – Interview 
transcript, March 17, 2022. 

Cause 3: Unregistered Inventory/Asset  
Informant K from Kemenag of West 

Sulawesi reported that in February 2022, their 
institution still faced issues with unregistered 
asset accounts appearing on the balance sheet. 
This issue arose partly due to the purchase of 
assets below the capitalization threshold using 
the capital expenditure account. The 
capitalization threshold for equipment and 
machinery is above one million rupiah, while 
for buildings, it is twenty-five million rupiah. 
The following statement was provided by 
Informant K (Kemenag of West Sulawesi) 
regarding the problem of unregistered asset 
accounts:   

"Capital expenditures below the 
capitalization threshold remain 
unresolved. We have already informed the 
satker, but the issue persists. One reason is 
that we received lump-sum funds (from the 
State Sharia Securities) under a single 
account. The budget was for capital 
expenditures (53). However, it was spent 
on capital goods below the capitalization 
threshold (e.g., tables and chairs). If we 
want to revise the budget, we must go 
through the central office (from Echelon I 
K to the DJA), and that is a lengthy 
process." – Interview transcript, March 17, 
2022. 

Informant K (Kemenag of West 
Sulawesi) also explained that other causes for 
unregistered asset accounts include satker 

failing to record fixed assets in the SIMAK 
application, data entry errors, and other 
factors. Identifying the transactions causing 
unregistered asset accounts often requires 
significant time, as financial operators must 
sift through transactions one by one to locate 
the problematic entries. Once identified, 
operators must then take the necessary steps 
to remove the unregistered asset accounts.  

From the informants’ explanations, 
various issues related to BMN management 
have hindered the preparation of financial 
reports at both the UAKPA and UAPPA-W 
levels. Informant P from Polda West Sulawesi 
added that several BMN officers under his 
coordination were unwilling to sign off on the 
reports until the BMN data issues were 
resolved. This, of course, further delayed the 
preparation of financial reports at both the 
UAKPA and UAPPA-W levels.  

Delay Causes from the Financial Data 
Management Cluster. The second cluster 
consists of various issues related to financial 
data management. These challenges hinder 
the completion of financial reports, as satker 
(work units) strive to resolve all issues to 
ensure high-quality reports. Based on 
interviews with several UAPPA-W units, the 
following financial data issues were 
identified. Cause 4: Budget Deficits   

 budget deficit occurs when actual 
expenditures exceed the allocated budget. 
This situation commonly arises in employee-
related expenses due to factors such as 
increases in staffing, salary hikes, allowances, 
or other payroll components. While a budget 
deficit in employee expenses is allowed to 
ensure all civil servants receive their rightful 
income each month, it must be resolved 
through a budget revision (DIPA) to ensure 
the deficit does not appear in the annual 
financial reports. Unfortunately, interviews 
with UAPPA-W units revealed that budget 
deficits were still present during the 
preparation of annual financial reports. 
Informant K from the Ministry of Religious 
Affairs in West Sulawesi provided the 
following information: 
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"As of now (March 2022), there are still 
budget deficits in employee expenses. Two 
work units, Satker A and Satker B, have yet 
to resolve the issue. Satker A has a six-
billion-rupiah deficit, and Satker B has a 
nine-billion-rupiah deficit. We wanted to 
draw funds from other provinces, but they 
need them too (so the revision couldn't be 
done). So, the deficit remains." – Interview 
transcript, March 17, 2022. 

Resolving budget deficits within the 
West Sulawesi K/L units must involve 
coordination with their respective central 
offices, as the employee expense budgets for 
all K/L units in West Sulawesi are already 
exhausted. This issue was also experienced by 
the Kejati (High Prosecutor’s Office) of West 
Sulawesi, as noted by Informant J: 

"Yes, we had to revise the employee 
expense budget deficit. There was an issue 
with Satker XYZ—while they claimed it was 
fixed, the budget deficit persisted. It seems 
that, as of now (March 2022), the deficit 
remains. I have raised the issue, but 
nothing has changed. I suggested they 
check the deficit in the OMSPAN 
(application). Now, with the SAKTI 
application, they can directly check the 
deficit. However, the central office has 
asked us not to prepare the financial report 
yet." – Interview transcript, March 17, 
2022. Cause 5: Incomplete Projects  

Another issue affecting financial report 
data is the presence of incomplete projects that 
extend beyond the fiscal year. These projects 
continue into the next fiscal year, resulting in 
ongoing financial transactions, such as 
contractor fines or project payments. If the 
financial report is prepared while the project 
is still incomplete, some transactions may not 
be reflected in the report. Consequently, one 
UAPPA-W unit delayed its financial report 
preparation due to such a case, as explained by 
Informant J from the Kejati of West Sulawesi: 

"Regarding the data, there are projects in 
the penalty phase. Usually, this lasts 90 
days, and it must be included in the report. 
Ideally, the report should be submitted 
after March. As of now (March 2022), 

there are still ongoing projects (from the 
2021 fiscal year)." – Interview transcript, 
March 17, 2022. 

The financial data issues described 
above have led UAKPA and UAPPA-W units 
to delay financial report preparation until 
these problems are resolved, as conveyed by 
Informant P from the West Sulawesi Police 
Department (Polda): 

"How can we prepare the CaLK (Notes to 
Financial Statements) when the data in the 
e-rekon application keeps changing? This 
year (2021) has taken much longer. Last 
year, the CaLK was ready by February." – 
Interview transcript, March 17, 2022. 

Some central government 
ministries/agencies have even instructed 
UAKPA and UAPPA-W units not to prepare 
financial reports until the financial data issues 
are resolved, as mentioned by Informant J 
from the Kejati of West Sulawesi: 

"We were about to prepare the report, but 
the central office instructed us not to 
proceed (with updating the reconciliation 
status to 'READY FOR DOWNLOAD'), so 
we couldn’t finalize the report because the 
data wasn’t fixed." – Interview transcript, 
March 17, 2022. 

Delaying the preparation of financial 
reports until the data is accurate is 
understandable, as any data discrepancies in 
the financial statements could become audit 
findings and negatively impact the audit 
opinion. All UAPPA-W units whose satker 
experienced financial data issues faced delays 
in submitting their reports to the DJPb 
Regional Office of West Sulawesi. 
Conversely, UAPPA-W units whose satker 
did not encounter such issues were able to 
submit their financial reports on time. In 
conclusion, financial data issues are one of the 
primary causes of delays in the preparation 
and submission of financial reports. 

Delay Causes from the Human 
Resources Cluster. Operators play a crucial 
role in the preparation of financial reports. 
From interviews with eight UAPPA-W units, 
several challenges related to the personnel 
responsible for financial report preparation 
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were identified. Cause 6: Preparer 
Incompetency 

One of the report preparers, who was 
delayed, was preparing the UAPPA-W 
financial report for the first time. Moreover, 
the knowledge transfer process from the 
previous employee was ineffective. In some 
cases, necessary files for financial report 
preparation were not handed over by the 
outgoing employee. This significantly slowed 
down the report preparation process, 
especially since the change in operators 
occurred during the report preparation period. 
Informant B from BPJN of West Sulawesi 
highlighted this issue: 

"The problem is, the person was replaced 
yesterday. They should have continued 
working on it, even though they were 
retiring. But they didn’t teach anything. 
They just left. Communication was poor. 
The regional access codes were only 
provided after much insistence. This really 
slowed things down. I kept pushing, and we 
only got the codes last week." – Interview 
transcript, March 30, 2022. Cause 7: 
Financial Reporting as Side Job 

In some work units, there is no specific 
employee assigned to handle financial report 
preparation. As a result, financial reporting 
tasks are often assigned to employees whose 
primary duties are not related to financial 
management. Consequently, financial report 
preparation becomes a secondary task, as 
operators prioritize their main responsibilities. 
Informant K from Kemenag of West Sulawesi 
explained this issue: 

"There is no designated position for 
financial report preparers in each 
department. So, if someone is handling 
financial management, it’s only an 
additional responsibility, while their 
primary duties take precedence. Therefore, 
no one in the department is specifically 
responsible for the financial reports." – 
Interview transcript, March 17, 2022. 
Cause 8: Preparer Shortage 

One of the operators interviewed was 
responsible for preparing eight UAPPA-W 
financial reports, which is a significant 

workload. Moreover, all eight reports had the 
same submission deadline. This challenge was 
described by Informant K from Kemenag of 
West Sulawesi: "I am handling eight 
programs here by myself. That includes seven 
UAPPA-W units and one satker. In addition, I 
also input performance achievements for two 
satker." – Interview transcript, March 17, 
2022. 

The shortage of personnel was also an 
issue for some UAKPA units. This limitation 
resulted in problematic data quality at the 
UAKPA level and the neglect of UAKPA 
financial report preparation. Since UAPPA-W 
financial reports are a consolidation of 
UAKPA reports, any obstacles at the UAKPA 
level will affect the preparation of UAPPA-W 
reports. 

Delay Causes from the Information 
Technology Utilization Cluster. Cause 9: 
Underutilized Financial Application. The 
DJPb has developed an MS-Excel-based 
application to assist UAKPA and UAPPA-W 
in preparing financial reports (LK). 
Unfortunately, interviews with several 
UAPPA-W units revealed that only one 
UAPPA-W is using the application for 
financial report preparation. The reasons for 
not utilizing the application are as follows:  
First, the application is too complex to use, 
requiring many manual steps in the report 
preparation process. This complexity results 
in extended timeframes for completing 
financial reports. Informant T mentioned that 
preparing reports using the MS-Excel 
application actually took longer than using 
previously created templates: 

"Using that Excel application is 
complicated. First, you have to convert the 
PDF to Excel, then enter the data into the 
application by copying and pasting. After 
that, you still have to check the results. The 
output is still in Excel format, so you need 
to convert it from Excel to PDF and then to 
a Word file, and then edit again. It's too 
cumbersome. It's easier to start with Word, 
especially since I already have a template 
from the previous year." – Interview 
transcript, March 30, 2022. 
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Second, the reports generated by the 
application are not always accurate. In 
addition to being complex, the validity of the 
output data is often questionable, as noted by 
Informant K from Kemenag of West 
Sulawesi, Informant B from BPJN of West 
Sulawesi, and Informant P from Polda of West 
Sulawesi, who all reported frequent errors in 
the application’s output. Cause 10: Slow Data 
Updates  

To ensure data accuracy, satker must 
reconcile their data with the data at the 
Ministry of Finance (Kemenkeu). This 
reconciliation is done by uploading data from 
the SAIBA application to the “e-rekon&LK” 
application. Once the data is verified as 
correct, UAKPA/UAPPA-W can download 
the report from the application. However, a 
challenge arises when data updates in the “e-
rekon&LK” application occur only a day after 
the satker uploads the data. This delay 
hampers financial report preparation due to 
the limited time available for report 
finalization. Informant H from 
Kemenkumham of West Sulawesi explained: 
"Delays usually happen because the data is 
still incorrect in e-rekon. For example, if there 
are discrepancies, they need to be corrected." 
– Interview transcript, March 30, 2022. 

Delay Causes from the Internal 
Organizational Cluster. Cause 11: Lack of 
Formal Communication. Based on interviews 
with eight UAPPA-W units, only four 
Echelon I units formally communicated with 
subordinate institutions regarding the 
obligation of UAKPA/UAPPA-W to submit 
financial reports (LK). Formal 
communication between institutions should 
take the form of an official memo or letter 
signed by an authorized official. UAPPA-W 
units that did not receive formal 
communication were only informed about 
their reporting obligations through informal 
channels. Informant K from Kemenag of West 
Sulawesi mentioned that the request for 
financial reports was conveyed solely through 
messages in the WhatsApp group for financial 
report operators. In some cases, Echelon I 
units did not request financial reports from 

UAPPA-W, either formally or informally, as 
stated by Informant B from BPJN of West 
Sulawesi: "The reports requested were only 
from the satker (UAKPA) to be sent to the 
central office." – Interview transcript, March 
30, 2022. 

According to monitoring documents, 
UAPPA-W units that were not formally 
requested by the central office to submit their 
reports were unable to do so on time. 
Conversely, UAPPA-W units that received 
official requests for financial reports managed 
to submit their reports on time. This indicates 
that formal communication plays a crucial 
role in the timeliness of financial report 
submission. The absence of formal 
communication from Echelon I units, which 
hierarchically oversee UAKPA/UAPPA-W, 
leads to a lack of urgency among 
UAKPA/UAPPA-W units to submit their 
reports promptly. Cause 12: Lack of Formal 
Warnings  

Another cause of delayed financial 
report preparation is the absence of formal 
sanctions or warnings from Echelon I units to 
UAPPA-W or UAKPA for failing to submit 
their reports on time. Even when reminders 
were given, they were often conveyed 
informally via WhatsApp messages. This lack 
of formal reprimands meant that operators at 
UAKPA and UAPPA-W felt no pressure to 
complete their reports promptly. Informant J 
from Kejati of West Sulawesi highlighted this 
issue: "Yes, there are no formal warnings or 
sanctions for UAKPA that are late, and the 
only reminder is through WhatsApp, asking 
them to finish it as soon as possible." – 
Interview transcript, March 17, 2022. Cause 
13: Slow Data Submission  

Another organizational factor 
contributing to delays in financial report 
preparation is the slow submission of data or 
financial reports from UAKPA to UAPPA-W 
or the KPPN. UAKPA data and reports are 
essential for preparing UAPPA-W reports, as 
the UAPPA-W report is a consolidation of the 
reports from the UAKPA units under its 
coordination. All informants from UAPPA-W 
units that experienced delays mentioned the 
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slow submission of data and reports by 
UAKPA as a major cause. Informant J from 
Kejati of West Sulawesi explained: 

"The data from satker is often submitted 
late, and even when they are submitted, 
they are often incomplete. Out of the five 
UAKPA units under our coordination, only 
one satker consistently submits data and 
reports on time." – Interview transcript, 
March 17, 2022. Cause 14: Lack of 
Recognition 

Another factor that hinders the 
preparation of financial reports is the lack of 
organizational support for the process. A 
representative from Kemenag of West 
Sulawesi stated that support from leadership 
for financial report preparation still needs 
improvement. The satker felt that 
management tends to focus more on budget 
planning and execution. A similar sentiment 
was expressed by Informant B from BPJN of 
West Sulawesi, who noted: 

"The process of preparing financial 
reports is somewhat neglected by the 
organization compared to budget planning 
and execution. There is also a lack of 
appreciation for us as financial report 
preparers." – Interview transcript, March 
18, 2022. 

Delay Causes from the External 
Organizational Cluster. The timeliness of 
financial report preparation within ministries 
and government agencies (K/L) is not only 
determined by the K/L itself but also by 
external organizations such as the Ministry of 
Finance (Kemenkeu) as the supervisory body, 
and the Supreme Audit Agency (BPK) as the 
financial report auditor. Based on interviews, 
several factors from external organizations 
that directly or indirectly affect the timeliness 
of financial report preparation were identified: 
Cause 15: Absence of Formal Requests  

In the preparation of UAPPA-W-level 
financial reports, data from UAKPA is 
crucial. Ideally, this data should consist of 
UAKPA-level financial reports, which are 
then submitted to UAPPA-W, UAPA-E1, and 
KPPN. However, according to interviews, 
Informant B mentioned that KPPN did not 

formally request UAKPA-level financial 
reports. This lack of formal request caused 
UAKPA to be reluctant in preparing its 
financial reports, which in turn delayed the 
preparation of UAPPA-W reports. Informant 
J explained: "There was no formal memo or 
written request, only messages through each 
province's WhatsApp group, and the reports 
were sent in PDF format." – Interview 
transcript, March 17, 2022. Cause 16: Lack of 
Penalties for Late Submission  

According to the Ministry of Finance 
Regulation (PMK) No. 215/PMK.05/2016, 
which amends PMK No. 213/PMK.05/2013 
concerning the Central Government 
Accounting and Financial Reporting System, 
penalties are imposed on accounting entities 
that fail to perform reconciliation and/or 
submit financial reports on time. The penalty 
involves the return of the Payment Order 
(SPM) by KPPN to the satker 
(UAKPA/UAPPA-W), with exceptions for 
employee expenses, third-party invoices, and 
refund claims. The imposition of sanctions is 
based on the issuance of a Notice of Penalty 
(SP2S) due to negligence in reconciliation and 
financial report submission. SP2S for 
UAPPA-W units that delay financial report 
submission is issued by KPPN based on the 
recommendation from the DJPb Regional 
Office. 

According to data from the DJPb 
Regional Office in West Sulawesi, no 
penalties have been imposed on UAPPA-W 
units for late submission of financial reports. 
The absence of penalties for 
UAKPA/UAPPA-W delays in submitting 
financial reports ultimately reduces the 
compliance of these units with timely 
submission requirements. 

 Solutions to Address Delays. To 
address the various issues causing delays in 
the submission of financial reports (LK), two 
primary solutions can be implemented. 
Solution 1: Implementation of Internal 
Control for Financial Reporting . Based on 
monitoring documents, one UAPPA-W unit 
that consistently submits financial reports on 
time is the DJPb Regional Office of West 
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Sulawesi. In addition to being timely, the 
quality of its financial reports consistently 
ranks among the top three. According to 
interviews with Informant Tr and document 
analysis, all DJPb offices, including the 
Kanwil DJPb of West Sulawesi, have 
implemented Internal Control for Financial 
Reporting (PIPK). According to PMK No. 
17/PMK.09/2019, PIPK is a specific control 
mechanism designed to provide reasonable 
assurance that the financial reports produced 
are reliable and prepared in accordance with 
government accounting standards. The 
implementation of PIPK has been a key factor 
in ensuring both the timeliness and quality of 
financial reports at Kanwil DJPb of West 
Sulawesi. The following is an excerpt from an 
interview with Informant Tr from DJPb 
Regional Office of West Sulawesi regarding 
the implementation of PIPK at their office: 

"The implementation of PIPK is carried 
out by management, in this case, the 
General Affairs Department as the first 
line. Our department provides quality 
assurance by evaluating whether the entire 
financial report preparation process 
complies with the established regulations 
and documents. The General Affairs 
Department ensures that financial 
activities are conducted in accordance 
with the rules, while we assess the PIPK 
implementation." – Interview transcript, 
December 27, 2022. 

The practical application of entity-level 
internal control refers to the components and 
principles of internal control as defined by 
COSO, which has been adopted in PMK No. 
17/PMK.09/2019. COSO's internal control 
framework consists of five components and 
seventeen principles. Several of these 
principles are closely related to the issues that 
cause delays in financial report submission, as 
described earlier. In addition to entity-level 
control, internal controls are also applied at 
the process/transaction level, specifically 
designed to mitigate risks in the transaction 
processing. At Kanwil DJPb of West 
Sulawesi, specific focus is given to 
transactions related to Fixed Assets such as 

Buildings, Equipment, and Machinery. This 
approach aligns with the research findings, 
which indicate that one of the main causes of 
delays in financial report submission is the 
mismanagement of BMN (state-owned assets) 
data (19). Solution 2: Development of a 
Financial Reporting and Monitoring 
Application 

One of the causes of delays is the 
suboptimal financial reporting application 
developed by DJPb, which does not fully meet 
user expectations and is thus seldom used. On 
the other hand, one K/L, specifically the 
Central Bureau of Statistics (BPS) in West 
Sulawesi, has developed an application to 
assist in preparing financial reports and 
monitoring submissions from subordinate 
institutions. As a result, institutions within this 
K/L have been able to produce high-quality 
financial reports and submit them on time. 
Therefore, it is recommended to develop an 
application with features similar to the one 
created by this K/L. The features of the 
application include the web-based monitoring 
application.  

Based on direct observations of the 
application and interviews with Informants W 
and A from BPS West Sulawesi, the financial 
reporting application developed by the K/L is 
web-based. The advantage of a web-based 
application is that it can be accessed directly 
through a browser without the need for 
additional installations and can be updated at 
any time. Informant W explained: 

"We have a web-based application called 
e-CaLK, created by the central finance 
office of BPS. We upload the SAIBA ADK 
file, then click 'generate table,' and the 
tables for the financial report will appear." 
– Interview transcript, March 18, 2022. 

From this interview, it is evident that the 
application can generate the required tables 
for financial report preparation. The report 
preparer only needs to add the narrative, 
allowing reports to be prepared more quickly. 
The tables generated are also accurate, so the 
operator does not need to perform additional 
checks. Informant A further elaborated on the 
web-based feature and table generation: 
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"When you download it, it's already in 
financial report format. You just need to 
add the narrative for the figures. The 
output is in both Word and PDF formats, 
usable for both regions and work units." – 
Interview transcript, March 18, 2022. 

In addition, the application includes a menu 
for submitting scanned financial reports that 
have been signed. This feature allows the 
scanned reports to be stored within the 
application and accessed from anywhere with 
an Internet connection. The application also 
includes a financial report submission 
monitoring feature, enabling institutions to 
monitor the submission status of financial 
reports from their subordinate units. This 
monitoring feature is expected to improve the 
timeliness of financial report submissions. 
 
4. Conclusion 

This study aims to examine the factors 
contributing to delays in the submission of 
UAPPA-W financial reports (LK), 
categorized into six clusters, along with 
proposed solutions to address these delays. 
The first cluster pertains to the management of 
state-owned assets (BMN) and includes three 
inhibiting factors: the occurrence of BMN 
data anomalies, discrepancies in BMN 
transfers (TK/TM), and the appearance of 
unrecorded inventory/asset accounts on the 
balance sheet. The second cluster addresses 
issues in financial data management, 
comprising two key obstacles: budget deficits 
and unfinished projects at the time of annual 
financial report preparation. The third cluster 
involves human resource challenges, 
including three factors: insufficient 
competence of UAPPA-W financial report 
preparers, the assignment of financial 
reporting as an additional responsibility, and 
the limited number of personnel available for 
financial report preparation. The fourth cluster 
focuses on the utilization of information 
technology, with two main barriers: the 
financial reporting application’s lack of 
optimization for report preparation, and 
significant delays in updating data within the 
"e-Rekon&LK" application. The fifth cluster 

pertains to internal organizational factors, 
which include four challenges: the lack of 
formal communication from Echelon I units to 
subordinate agencies regarding UAKPA/ 
UAPPA-W’s obligation to submit financial 
reports, the absence of warnings or sanctions 
from Echelon I units for delays in UAPPA-W 
financial report submission, slow data 
submission by UAKPA, and inadequate 
recognition of UAPPA-W financial report 
preparers. The sixth cluster involves external 
organizational factors, consisting of two key 
issues: the absence of formal requests for 
financial reports from KPPN to UAKPA, and 
the lack of sanctions from KPPN or the DJPb 
Regional Office for UAKPA and UAPPA-W 
units that submit financial reports late. 

In addition to identifying these 
obstacles, the study also proposes solutions to 
support timely UAPPA-W financial report 
submission. These include the 
implementation of internal control for 
financial reporting within ministries and 
government agencies, and the development of 
an application that facilitates the preparation, 
submission, and monitoring of financial 
reports. The implementation of PIPK should 
be based on PMK No. 17/PMK.09/2019. 
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